COUNTY OF ORANGE
RESOURCES & DEVELOPMENT
MANAGEMENT DEPT.
CONSTRUCTION DIVISION

BID OPENING SUMMARY REPORT
5/14/2008

2:00 P.M.

DATE:

TIME:

proJECT: SAN JUAN CREEK CHANNEL WEST LEVEE PHASE |
LiMITs: 1700" TO 5700" UPSTREAM OF STONEHILL DRIVE

WORK ORDER # _EF07391
ENGR'S EST. BID ALT. A: $18,007,635.12
ENGR'S EST. BID ALT. B: $16,762,222.08

TOTAL BID PRICE

TOTAL BID PRICE

BIDDER cImy ALT. A ALT.B BOND
BALDWIN
1. MIKE BUBALO CONSTRUCTION CO. PARK $15,913,060.10 No Bid 10%
2. AMERICAN CIVIL CONSTRUCTORS BENICIA $12,112,134.43 $11,959,907.65 10%
NEWPORT
3. METRO BUILDERS & ENGRS. GRP., LTD. BEACH $15,445,880.38 $16,202,989.32 10%
4. J-F. SHEA CONSTRUCTION, INC. WALNUT $11,725,778.00 No Bid 10%
5. SKANSKA USA CIVIL RIVERSIDE $13,850,987.00 $13,569,373.00 10%
6. BLUE IRON, INC. SACRAMENTO $17,734,755.67 No Bid 10%
NORTH
7. MCM CONSTRUCTION, INC. HIGHLANDS $14,264,672.00 $14,986,449.00 10%
8. PETERSON-CHASE GEN ENG"G IRVINE $13,740,665.00 No Bid 10%
9. BEADOR CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. CORONA $11,937,700.00 $12,407,700.00 10%
10. CONDON-JOHNSON & ASSOC. CYPRESS $13,382,061.90 No Bid 10%
11. DUTRA CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. SAN RAFAEL $13,468,837.00 $13,982,247.00 10%
12. FTR INTERNATIONAL INC. IRVINE $15,136,271.00 $14,314,260.00 10%
13. SHIMMICK CONSTRUCTION CO., INC. OAKLAND $15,359,342.00 $15,330,998.00 10%
LAKE

14. SEMA CONSTRUCTION, INC. FOREST $13,750,264.75 $12,951,947.90 10%
{PPARENT LOW BIDDER. NO. 4 _ J.F.SHEA CONSTRUCTION,INC. pRicE: _$11,725,778.00

ITEM LISTED SUBCONTRACTORS cITY

AC PAVING CALMEX RIVERSIDE

REBAR AMERICAN STEEL PLACER COLTON

BID PROPOSALS RECEIVED FROM CLERK BY:

CARMENCITA VILLANUEVA




